
RFP P21-03, Additional Internet  - Non Cost Evaluation

RFP P21-03 Additional Internet                                         

Non-Cost Specifications                                                           

Max Points Available: 40

ENA ATT

Criteria / Points Available

Methodology & Scope of          

Work  (Technical Proposal) 

(3.0 Special T&C)                                                                     

Points Available: 20

Excellent (100%) - 20 Points Excellent (100%) - 20 Points

Vendor Profile                   

(Vendor Questionnaire, 

References)                                                    

Points Available: 10

Excellent (100%) - 10 Points

Good (80%) - 8 Points (Lack of 

information included in the RFP 

on references and SLA 

management)

Erate Capabilities & Guarantee                                

(2.10 & 3.3 of Special T&C)                                                                                  

Points Available: 10

Excellent (100%) - 10 Points Excellent (100%) - 10 Points

Total Points 40 38

Notes: Non-Cost Determined Utilizing Scoring Matrix Relative to Points Available: Excellent=100%, Very Good= 90%, 

Good=80%, Adequate=70%, Marginal=60%, Poor=25%, Unacceptable=0%



RFP P21-03, Additional Internet Cost Evaluation

RFP P21-03 Additional Internet 

Cost                                                                                                  

Max Points Available: 60

ENA ATT

Cost Per Month For 20 GBPS         

(36 Month Term)
$7,975.00 $12,675.54

Annual Cost Per For 20 GBPS         

(36 Month Term)
$95,700.00 $152,106.48

Grand Total Cost Per For 20 

GBPS at 36 Months                                      

(36 Month Term)

$287,100.00 $456,319.44

TOTAL POINTS 
Cost Evaluation Formula: 

(Lowest Price/R-where “R” 

represents the cost of proposal 

currently being ranked) x Points = 

Score.)

60 37.75

Notes FCS detemined that the 20 GBPS intenet option best met the overall needs of the 

district based on capacity and overall value. 
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RFP P21-03 Additional Internet Bid Form

RFP P21-03 Additional Internet 

Bid Form                                                                                               
ENA ATT

True 10 Gbps As Specified     

(12 Month Pricing)
N/A $4,217.30

True 10 Gbps As Specified     

(36 Month Pricing)
$5,625.00 $4,217.30

True 10 Gbps As Specified     

(60 Month Pricing)
$5,300.00 $4,217.30

Alternate 12.5 Gpbs                

(12 Month Pricing)
No Bid No Bid

Alternate 12.5 Gpbs                

(36 Month Pricing)             
$6,825.00 No Bid

Alternate 12.5 Gpbs                

(60 Month Pricing)             
$5,975.00 No Bid

Alternate 15 Gpbs                   

(12 Month Pricing)
No Bid No Bid

Alternate 15 Gpbs                   

(36 Month Pricing)             
$7,275.00 No Bid

Alternate 15 Gpbs                   

(60 Month Pricing)             
$6,425.00 No Bid

Alternate 20 Gpbs                   

(12 Month Pricing)
No Bid $12,675.54

Alternate 20 Gpbs                   

(36 Month Pricing)             
$7,975.00 $12,675.54

Alternate 20 Gpbs                   

(60 Month Pricing)             
$7,125.00 $12,675.54



ENA ATT

Non- Cost Points           

(40 Available)
40 38

Cost Points                 

(60 Available)
60 37.75

Total 100 75.75

RFP P21-03 Additional Internet -Summary of Final Award


